
(Contract Management Use only) 

CONTRACT APPROVAL FORM 

10\10E.C 21 p~\ 4: \G 
CONTRACT 

TRACKING NO. 

CONTRACTOR INFORMATION 
C.YY! iq i()-oL/ 

Name: CopyFax- Jacksonville 

Address: 6631 N Executive Park Court Suite 210 Jacksonville FL 32216 
City State Zip 

Contractor's Administrator Name:_-"M"-r"-. -"'R,.,ic"'h"'ar,..d'-!D"u'"r"'an"'t~------- Title: Sales Manager 

Tel#: 904-296-1600 Ext24l3 Fax: ~9,..0,-;4c:,-2<c;9,6c:_-7ulul_;_l_ Email: richard.durant@copyfax.com 

CONTRACT INFORMATION 

Contract Name: Ricoh MPC4502 Color Copier Lease & Maintenance Agreement Contract Value: 

Brief Description: Piggybacking offUniverity of South Florida Contract 9-13-G for Lease & Maintenance Color Copier 

Contract Dates: From: DEC 12 to Nov 15 Status: X New Renew Amend# W A/Task Order r-.) 
I .J 

How Procured: Sole Source _Single Source _ ITB _ RFP _RFQ Coop. X Other PiggyBacking - (_) 

IfP1·ocessing an Amendment: 

Contract#: Increase Amount of Existing Contract: No Increase ------ --------

New Contract Dates: _____ to ____ _ TOTAL OR AMENDMENT AMOUNT: ------''-'-'•i.'' __ 
--. •• j 

PURSUANT TO NASSAU COUNTY PURCHASING POLICY, SECTION 6 

I. ----;>c~~~~Ff=~~~----<:,Jk~-L- Lease/Maintenance 03400541-5440~546~~0 
Date Funding Source/ Acct # 

2. 

3. '2- - '1.-( --I ')..... 
Date 

4. 

..., 
,.. ;rJ 

~ f);u 
--jn1 

I ( :r"" (') 
w --m 

}.>-

~ ~t:.< :x :.o-m 
GJO 

w In .. :~ 
{Jl rn 
0) 

Comments: ____________________________________ _ 

C0~4NALSIGNATUR::~~~:: 
TedSelby? ~ ~D,;;e 

RETURN OIUGINAL(S) TO CONTRACT MANAGEMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION AS FOLLOWS: 
Original: Clerk's Services; Contractor (original or certified copy) 
Copy: Department 

Office of Management & Budget 
Contract Management 
Clerk Finance 

t ,j 
'--· 

J' ) 

Cl 



CCPYFA 

Jacksonville «<+ 
6631 N Executive Park Court 
Suite210 
Jacksonville, FL 32216 
Phone: 904.296.1600 
Fax: 904.296.71 t 1 

PROPOSAL 
FOR 

NASSAU COUNTY 
ROAD & BRIDGE 

RICOH MPC4502 COLOR COPIER 
PB3130 PAPER FEED UNIT 
SR3120 STAPLER FINISHER 
PUNCH UNIT 3030 
BRIDGE UNIT BU3060 
FAX OPTION 5502 

TOTAL MONTHLY LEASE 

UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA 9-13-G -

$ 119.47 
14.21 
35.91 
7.89 
2.17 
9.99 

$189.64 

MAINTENANCE AND SUPPLY AGREEMENT 

BASE MONTHLY CHARGE OF $39.00 INCLUDES UP TO 
6,000 BLACK AND WHITE PRINTS PER MONTH. EXCESS 
BLACK AND WHITE PRINTS AT $.0065 PER PRINT. ALL 
COLOR PRINTS AT $.065 PER COLOR PRINT. INCLUDES 
ALL TONERS AND SUPPLIES EXCEPT PAPER AND STAPLES. 

36 MONTH LEASE 

Gainesville -
3210 SW 40th Blvd. 
Su!teA·l 
Gainesville, fL 32608 
Phone: 352.336.1771 
Fax: 352.336.8151 

St. Augustine -
140 Gateway Circle 
Suite t 
St. Johns, Fl32259 
Phone: 904.827.0178 
Fax: 904.208.5105 

Daytona Beach «<+ 
480 Fentress Blvd 
Sultel 
Daytona Beach, FL 32114 
Phone: 386.252.2292 
Fax: 386.252.0920 

(B VV:W'W.GOPY'F'AX.GOM - ~ 



nn~~ 

jfiu£ft~Mi~~oMifiifi iiiUi~ftti~HiK~ i~o~£~&~U u~~i 

i I 
l 

0 

~ 
~ I 

I 
!i 

I ~ ~~ ~~ I f ~ ~ gg 8. 

if 
~ 

~ " • 
I § § 

I 
0 

~ g 
I ~ 

i 
§ 

i ~ 

r 
I' """ ! '." tq~a 
! ~;d 

~ 

U'l 
II 
-=: -= ' 

-



--~----- ----

·~ oo~~~~~t PoUO~~-~Gh~2-~~ B~ 
" • ·~· •• " il b " •• " • ' " " •• " " " ••• " •• 

... ~ .. '"·····-~····~····-··· ~ B g·~- tl 8 \l t ~ ~ l'l G ~ 8 ::< 8 !';! ::i U 0 8 ~ 8 8 9. g g ~ 

;~~ 
..,~t I 
~!! ! 
~~g i 

I ~ ~i! I I •• !i i i i i 

oooooooooooo 

oooooooooooo -

' ~ ! 
!l > ~ • " I & • 

~ [ 

! ~ 

li ~ 

~ 



---~-------------------------------------

'PI 
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• AW ARDEDI BI.DS • 

INVITATION TO NEGOTIATE NUMBER: 9-13-G 

Award To: 

Bell Techlogix, Inc. 

Dell Marketing L.P. 

Konica Minolta Business 
Solutions U.S.A.,. Inc. --- ·~ C Ricoh. Americas Corpor·ation ___) 

Xerox Corporation 

-y~-------·-· .. -·--·-- ~-~ _______ ,,. . .,.,.,_._ .. -----····- ., -·-

BID.TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional 
Printers 

Lot: 

Lot I 

Lot I 

Lot ·n 

Lots I & 

Lots I & II 

'~ 



fN PROPOSAL TABULATION 
iN TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

~NUMBER: ""9·"-'13""-G"'---------­
IPENING DATE: May22, 2009 TIME 3:00P.M. 

WARDED DATE . OcT ~~. 'Qdo/ 
OSTING TIME/DATE A ~ 

FROM: "e:. !>~""> f. /Q l~Q1 
,~ t 

UNTIL: '2.pn r ltJP'/tJt:t 
PAGE: I OF Lt PAGE(S) 

DESCRIPTION/VENDORS 1)o~ro4..S~!l 
ITN COVER SIGNED -~@§) NC 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 S.IGNED (§) NO 

ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGNED I~YE_0 N':) 

EEO SIGNED CS>·· NO· 

W9 SIGNED ~S'' . NO 

'FAILURE TO EILE A PROTEST WI'l'Rl:N TEE TI!l1E. PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57 (3) r 
FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAIL'tmE TO P.OST 'TEE :BOND OR OTBE'R SECIJ.EU":CX :REQ'CT.llOO)· 
F!'l :!CAW WITBIN ~EE · TIM~' ALLOWED FOR E'I!J:NG A :SO~"D ,5.6l\X.L CONSTI= A WAI'IEB. 
OF PROcEEDINGS UNDE~ ~TER ~20 1 FLORIDA STA!WT.ES: ALL BIDS/l?ROPOS.ALS 
At;CEPTED BY THE STArE ARE .SOBJE.C'l' TO THE ST.ATE·' S TEEMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY 
AND AI.L ADOITIONA!i ;t!ERMS m;IP CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS .ARE 
RE.:;rECTED AND S.WU.L HAVE NO E'ORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM 'J:HE VENDORS LISTED 
HEREIN ARE Tli!: ONLY O:FFERS RECEiC·VED 'I'IMEL;t AS OF TE.E ABOVE OPENING DATE .AND 
T!ME. ALL OTBEF. OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO TB.IS, SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE 
HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. 

~- BEO.UJ:::rui:MENT- ANY PERSON" WHO PILES AN 
D DECISION PERTAINING TO A SOLICITATION 

SH8LL AT THE Til$ OF FILING ·OF TaE FORI.".JU. PROTEST, POST WITE. THE ONJ:VERSITY A 
B~NP PAYABLE TO THE UNIVERSITY OF SQU'l'H FLORIDA IN AN AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 . 
P~~CEN~ "OF TEE ESTIMATED.VALUE OF THE. PROTESTOR'S BID QR PROPOSAL: 10 PERCENT 
OF. THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE. DORING·' '!:HE CONTRACT T~:RM: $10,000: OR W'HICHEVER 
IS LESSv THE BOND SIDU.L. BE CONDITIONED UPON .THE PA~T PF ALL COSTS WF..ICR MAY 
BE AD;1UDGED AGAI·NST TI:ffi CONTRACTOR FILING· THE PROTEST ACTION- IN LIEU OF A 
BONDf THE UN!VERSIT~ MAY 1\.CCEPT A C11.SHIERtS CRECIC OR -MONEY ORDER IN THE .AMOUNT 
OF THE BOND. FZI.!L'CRE TO Fl:LE THE PROPER BOND A'l! THE ~DiE OE' FJ:L:WG THE FO~ 
PROTEST, SHALL RESULT :IN A. DENI.AL OF 'Hl:E J?RO'J:ES'l. 

~"""'.>;1".-..-.~l~""~'""-""'-' 

-~\\ <.' • ;-,''DeJ\ "'[o$ _;be;., · ,. ' . . Jb~ \t::S..s.. 
~ ~!P~.'l)~ . 1'11\o.rt~~l\g , .:r.s.1 ·*':\,},.:,D( ... s 

~~ NO f&\~\~@ I NO 

'~I NO 

,~1 NQ 

~~NO 
.~I. No 

~:)1 NO .I.·~ I N.O 

r?.Y'ES': I NO 11 C®.s ll ~ J. 
NO 

GE'JI ~No ifCYESJ NO 

'~INo~F~ NO 

Go-.1 . . . \ 
Co.l\f\<t'!.""-10('\ 

G~~ NO 
'. 
~.·~~. NO. 

r (iEs::)l NO 

~I NO 

,-~~· NO 

MINORITY-VENDOR 
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (H4). .Gi§) NO ~~ 

il'~ 
NO 11® NO 

.j 

YES I NO YES NO 

PROPOSAL CONTENT 

* PROPOSAL COPIEs 

NO BID 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) 

IPENED BY: Mark Lillguist 

CiE])·INo II~ I -No~·~ I No · li~VI NO 

\6(¥;,1\,.J '!::>1!0{i~ll \·o~~~(\~ 1l~(ila~llor;5~~~a). ~~~U>P;@S ~ofio,;,,.J 1{ w&e$ 
XES I · llO li YES ' I NO .I · YES J NO II YES I · NO 

L. t;>T :t. ~ {..O'T J:. 
l 
·j· 

~ ~~· 

TABULATED BY: L:no.m, Sb~oA1t_ VERIFIED BY: -"""' 

'EMARKS: CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD, 

~~I -....... NO 
. •I 

f. ~.<'0\'qi~ /J cc;p re., 
YES NO 

REV.817f2008 



N TITLE: Copiers. Prinfers and Multi,Functional Printers. FA:ILURE TO E'ILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE :I:I.MJ:; ·pBJ!:SCRlBW 'UI/ :S.t;t..:'J.'.l'Ul'l 
:1.20.57 (3) t FLORIDA S':l!A!WTES 1 OR E'AJ:L~. TO POST ~ BOND OR OTEER 
SECOlUTY REQU;rnED BY ~ w:i:mm TEE TIME! /ILLOWED FOR FILJNG A BOND 
SHALL CONSTITO~ A m.IVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNOER Cl!l\l?TER :!20, FLORIDA 
S~S. ALL BIDS/PltOPOSA.LS ACCEPTED BY THE STATE AF.E SUBJECT TO THE 
S'l"ATE 1 S TERMS AND CONDITIONS At.'!J) ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND 
CONOIT.IONS SUBMITT~D BY TRB BIDDERS/PROPOSERs ARE REJBCTE:D AND SHALL EAVE 
NO FORCE AND EFFECT. DF.FZRS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED H.EREI·N ARB THE ONLY 
OFFE;RS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING l::!ATE AND TIME. A!.JJ OTHER 
OFFERS SUBMI:r'l'ED IN B.ESPO:t"f$E TO THIS SDLICITA'l:ION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY 
REJECTED AS LATE. 

N NUMBER: 9·13-G 

PENING DATE: May 22, 20G9 

WARDED DATE 

OSTING TIME/DATE 
FROM: 

UNTIL: 

PAGE: d._ 

TIM!: 

I 

1._ ~-

OF . u i 

3:00P.M. 

PAGE(S) 

'""'.c.t;.-:;·..~.: ~.umG UQU:r:REME:NT- 3NY PERSON WBO FILES 
CSIOl>l OR ni'TENDED DECISION PERTAINING TO A 

SOLXCITATION SHALL AT THE TIME OF FILING OF·THE FO~~ PROTEST, POST 
\'ij"J:TH TEE UNIVERSITY A BOND l?AYABLE TO THE ONI;i.i"ERSITY O:fi' SOUTH FLORIDA IN 
AN AMOUN'l' EQUAL TO: 10 E!ERCENT 0F THE ESTIMAT,ED VALUE OF THE . 
~RO'l'ESTOR! S BID OR PROPOSAL: l 0 PERCENT OF THE ES'l'IM:!l.TED EZJ?ENDITURE: 
DURING TP.E CONTRAcT •TERM: ~10,000: 0~ WHXCHE~R IS LE~S. THE 20ND SHALL 
BE CONDITIONED UPON THE PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH MAX BE ADJUDGED 
AGA-TNST TEtE CONTRACTOR FILING THE PROTEST ACTION. IN I,IEtl OF A BOND, THE 
ONIVERSI'!'Y "MAY ACCEPT A CASHIER 1 S CHECK OR "MONEY OF.DER IN THE AMOUNT OF 
THE BOND. F.Al:LvaE" !r() F.ILE ~ PROJ?E:R BOND AT ~ ~~ OF Fn..:rNG ~HE FOF:MAL 
PROTEST r SEALL RES"OL'J! :rn' A DEh""'AA. OF 'm!E PROTEST. 

DESCR,IPTION/VENDO:RS c(/l .. t''j('.<:$'- ~.,):,;;fi("'~ 'PC.lvk<) l Gw. West-~s+ Xero . ' 1:) ' ? i . I 
· · SD\IihDI'I£ Cop.ce.:;;, C<>faphu;s. 1 "-1 C.Qn 1 

IT!:< COVER SIGNED ® NO @' NO r YES ® -<® NO ~ . NO 1 

ADDENDUM NO' 1 SIGNED @) . NO @ NO @) NO · . ([~ NO '::_.fu._)' NO ! 

APDENDUM NO .. 2 SIGNED YES . CEQ:) . ~ NO YES @ · I (Y~ NO _ ·'® NO ~ 
EEO SIGNED VESJ · NO @]) NO j_ YES .( N~ . (ffi) NO ·~ G§j) NO ! 
W9 SIGNED '-..YE~· NO ~ NO ~~ .. NO C@· NO. l ~ NO I 

MINORITY VENPOR ~ NO 4ES\ NO YES ~· ·eYE'[)· NO 
1 ~., NO 

ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44) ~ ~y ~ 

PROPOSAL CONTENT ~ NO @.) NO ~1) NO @-, · NO , Q!§) NO ~ 
#'PRoPosAL coPIEs J f- L/e.r:;::l,e,s, I +t{ l..opie.s. J+-d.. c:Dpie.s t J,~ Lj e..op:e~ U ..J..Lf coPies l 

NO BID YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO i YES NO ' I 
. : UT".J M~ M 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) · . ~ ; 

'PEN ED BY: Mark Lillguist 
l . s;J. ~I TABULATED BY: ~::-QZ..Q~a ~i(j M 18• . VERIFIED BY: ,.,_....;....... 

1EMARKS; CIRCLED PRICE iNDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. REV.S/7/2008 . 

-



N TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

N NUMBER: 9-13-G 

PENING DATE: May22. 2009 TIME 

WARDED DATE 

OSTING TIMEIDATE 
FROM: I 

UNTIL: I 

PAGE:_ 3_ OF L~ 

DESCRIPTION/~NDORS 

ITN COVER SIGNED 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED 

.ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIG!iiED 

EEO SIGNED 

W9 SIGNED 

MINORITY VENDOR 
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (*44) 

PROPOSAL CONTENT 

# PROPOSAL COPIES . 

NO BID 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) 

--.1;00 P.M. 

PAGE(S) 

NO 

NO 

-
C!!§S. 

·.~ 
.......-=..:..._ 

NO 

fAILURE TO FILE A PROTEST Wil:TH!N 'l'HE 'l;IME PRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57 (:3) 1 

FLORIDA S~S, OR FAD:iO!rn TO WS'I! THE BONP OR OTHER SECUB.ITY REQTJJ:BED 
BY I,Ni'l WITHIN .THE ~IME ALL0V1ED FOR F~LING A 130ND Sl!l\.LL CONSTI~TE A 
~ OF J?ROCEi:n:INGS 'UNDER CHAP~ J.20 1 FLOR:I:DA: STA-moTES. ALI. 
BIDS;/PROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY' THE STATE ARE :SUBJECT TO THE STATE 1 S TBF.US AND 
CONDITIONS W".D ANY. AND ALL ADDITIONAL TEBMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY THE 
BIPDERS/J?ROE'OSER.S ARE .REJECTED AND SHALL EAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS 
FROM THE VENDORS LISTED .HEREIN ARE TEE ONLY. OFFE;RS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF TEE 
ABOVE OPENING DATE AND T~ME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUllMIT'rED ·IN RESPONSE 'TO THIS 
SOLl'GITA.T:tON 1 IE ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE •. 

..... - ANY EIERSON WHO 'E'ILES AN 
mA 

OF TF...E FOEMAL PROTEST, POST WITH 
'l'RE UNJ:VERSITY A BOND PA~P.BDE TO THE UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN AN 
AMOUNT EQUAL TO; 10 PERCENT O'E' 'THE ESTIMATED VALUE OF THE PROTESTOR'S SIP. 
OR P,ROPOSAL: 10· PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED EXPEND! TORE· DuiuNG 'l'RE CONTRACT 
TERM: .$:10,000: .OR WRICHEVER IS· ToF.SS. TEE BOND ·SHALL BE CONDI"TIONED UPON TEE· 
PAYMENT OF ALL COSTS WHICH tr~Y BE ADJU~GED AGAINST TF.E CONTP.ACTOR FILING. 
THE PROTEST ACTION. IN LIEO OF A BOND, THE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT ]'. ' 
GASEIER r S CHECK OR MONEY ORD:SR L."'il TEE .AMOUNT OF THE BOND. 

-
NO 
-
NO 
-
NO 

NO 

NO 

NO 

PENED BY; Mark Lillguist TABULATED y.; L~c.v;1 ~ ~ > P ·11 '--' '"-"' VERIFIED BY..·.-----------

EMARKS: CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. 
REV .8/712008 



TN PROPOSAL TABULATION 
TN TITLE: Copiers. Printers and Multi-Functional Printers 

fN NUMBER: "'9·:..c:13""·G:::.._ _______ _ 

lPENING DATE: May 22, 2009 TIME 3:00P.M. 

<WARDED DATE'-------------' 

'OSTIN'G TIMEJDATE . 
FROM: !~----:---

UNTIL: ! ____ _ 

r r.v1...., ' v•. -r r-..-.<=>c\~}. -L[ J.~. 

DESCRIPTION/VENDORS 

. 

Y.efo;Z ... 
' 

.. ITN COVER SIGNED ~ NQ YES . . ... 

ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED (Yt:sJ .· NO .' 1, YES 

ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGJ1ED Q:§/. NO YES 

EEO SIGNED -(rYES~ NO· YES 
I 

W9 SIGNED ··. (YE~ NO ' YES ~. 

·I 
MINORITY· VENDO.R' @ NO ,· YES 

ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (~44) 

PROPOSAL CONTENT <§) NO I YES 
i 

# PROPOSAL COPIEp I 4· !.fctJf!ies. 
NO BID YES NO· ·.YES 

U;T"..! ~,..JJ;,. 

DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) 

" 

FAILURE TO FILE A ~ROTEST >1IT!!IN THE TI!iE ERESCRIBED IN SECTION l20.57 (3), 
FLORIDA S~$ t· ;OS FAILURE '320 l?OST THE BOND . OR OTHER SECORI:TY BEQ'OIRED "' 
BX LAW WITHIN THE !riME .?.LLQWED. FOR FILING A BO!:ID SHALL CONSTIWTE A 'WAII'J>R ' 
OF PROCEE!JJNGS UNDER CHZIP~ ,120, E'::WORIPA STATUTES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS ... 
ACCE?'l'ED BY TE.E STATE A.1tE{ SU'BJEC'l' TO THE. STATE r S TERMS AND COliDITIONS JI.ND ANY 
AND ALl;. ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BX '!BE BIDDERS/J?.ROPOSE:RS AE.E 
REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFEcT. .OFFERS FROM 'rHE VENDORS LISTED 
HEREIN 1U'Ul THE .Ol,rr.Y OFFE!{S REeEIVED TIMELY AS .OF TEE ABOVE O~ENING DATE AND 
T!ME. ALL OTH:E:R OFFERS SUBMITTED .IN RESPONSE TO TB.IS SOLICITATION, IF ANY,. ARE 
HEREBY REr$CTED AS LATE. 

ANY PERSON WEO FILES AN 
PERTAINING TO A SOLICITATION. 

SHALL AT THE TIME 0~ FILING OF ~HE FORMAL PROTEST1 POST WITH THE. UNIVERSITY A 
BOND PAYABLE XO l'RE QNiv:ERSI'l'Y OF SOUTH .FLORIDA IN AN A1"'100NT EQUAL TO: lO . 
P.ERCENT 0? TEE ESTIMATED V~UE OF THE PROTESTOR'S BID OR PRoEOSAL: 10 PERCENT 
OF THE EST~TED EXPENDITURE DURING' THE CONTRACT TERM: ~10 1 000: OR WHICHEVER 
IS LESS .. "THE BOI:i'D S:Em:LL BE CONDITIONED UE'ON T!iE E'AYMENT OJ: ALL COSTS. WHic:a tv!AY 
BE IDJJOOGE:D AGAINST THE CONTRACTOR FILING THE PROTEST ACT.ION. IN LIEU OF A 
:BOND, THE t.TN!VER.SITY MAY ACCEPT A CA.SHIE.~ 1 S CJ:"ECK OR MONEY ORDER IN T:iE A:."11.0UNT 
OF TEE. BOND. E'A:rLlj!RE TO. FILE TEE PROPER BOND A~ TF.:S:. ~IMiil OF ii'II.JNG THE FO:RMM. 
"'~"""'""'"'•' ............. II RSSOL!I! m A DEN"J:AL OF TEE "J?ROT:EST·. 

NO YES NO YES .. NO ·_·YES NO 

NO YES. NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

NO YES NO YES NO ' YES NO -.. 
NO YES :NO YES NO YES NO 

. 
NO YES NO YES NO YES NO 

N.O YES NO YES NO .YES NO 

NO YES Nb. · YES NO YES NO 

. -

)PENED BY: Mark Lil!guist TABULATED-BY.: Lo.,zara Shl)~e VERIFIED BY: -~ 

~EMARKS: CFRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD. 
REV.S/7/2008 


